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Maine Coon kittens, famous for their regal appearance and friendly temperament, are a true gem
in the feline world. These purebred Maine Coon kittens grow into large, muscular cats with a
luxurious coat, highlighted by a distinctive ruff around their neck. Their large, tufted ears and
bushy tails make them easily recognizable. Known for their sociable nature, our Maine Coon
kittens for sale are the ideal companions for families and individuals seeking loving, intelligent
pets. I Discover magnificent Maine Coon kittens, recognized for their friendly demeanor and large
size. All of our Maine Coon kittens are health-checked, social, and eager to become part of your
family. We adhere to ethical breeding standards to ensure you find the right Maine Coon
companion.

https://8o1.top/?k=mainecoon&t=animal


If you're looking for Maine Coon kittens near me , explore our blog to learn more about these
magnificent creatures and how to find the perfect Maine Coon companion from trusted Maine
coon breeders.We adhere to ethical breeding standards to ensure you find the right Maine Coon
companion. pretty faces - every maine cat for sale in our cattery has a distinct personality. Some
mainecoon kittens for sale might be better suited for active families, while others prefer quieter
homes. European Maine Coon Kittens When you start with the Kings and Queens of our bloodline,
how can the kittens not be absolutely gorgeous? Take a peek at some of our European Maine
Coon kittens in Wisconsin. If you’re interested in reserving a kitten, please send us a message to
ensure first pick! If your dream kitten is not available, please contact us to be placed on our
waiting list! Kittens - A day in the life Maine coon kitten playing NEW : 3 NEW Dynasty Litters
have officially entered our world! ***We have multiple babies available from 2-5 weeks old ****
Kittens from NEW litters (2-4 weeks old) NOT pictured below. We have lots of orange boys, torti
girls and other colors! Inquire about those by phone, email or text. (715-225-8053) We are taking
Reservation Deposits ($350) for these new litters. **Deposits NOT required but recommended.
Reserve yours today! These Exotic Maine Coon Kittens will not be available for long! CONTACT
US View Our Maine Coon Kittens Deposits for kittens are not returnable. Keep scrolling for
available kittens *** white sittingup Blue Blue Tabby POLY Male $3450 ~ SOLD white crouched
closeup poly Ragnar Black Silver Classic Tabby BIG Male $3250 ~ SOLD tree poly tree poly
white crouched sophia Loki Black Smoke -16 weeks old Male – Small/Medium Sized $2500~
Available koda sitting up Winston Red Silver Poly Male $3450 SOLD tree poly tree poly sophia
Sophie Black Silver Female $2350 tree poly sophia Artemis High Silver Shaded Male $3500~
SOLD sophia Zendaya Brown Tabby Female $2650~Sold sophia Medusa Blue Silver Classic
Female -Shy $2850~ Sold white crouched sophia Apollo Blue Solid Male $2900 – SOLD sophia
Lilith Torti Female $2150-sold sophia Daphne Brown Tabby Female Available $2500-Sold sophia
Matilda Black Female $2650 ~ SOLD sophia Bella Silver Tabby Female ~ SOLD sophia Zeus
Silver MALE $3250~ SOLD sophia Kali Brown Torti Female $2650 ~SOLD sophia Fiona Silver
Torti Female $2450 ~ SOLD sophia Molly Brown Tabby Female $2650 ~ Available sophia Margo
Blue Silver Female $2750 ~ SOLD sophia Willow Calico Female $2650 ~ SOLD sophia Oscar
Pale Orange Male $2850 ~SOLD sophia Felix Brown Tabby Male $2850 ~ SOLD sophia Roxy
Brown Torti Female $2650 ~SOLD sophia Apollo Solid White Male $2650 ~SOLD sophia
Charolette Brown Tabby Female $2850 ~ SOLD sophia Fiona Silver Torti Classic Tabby Female
$2650 SOLD sophia Freddy Red Tabby Classic Male $2450 – SOLD sophia Sophia Brown
Classic Tabby Female $2450 – SOLD sophia sophia sophia sophia sophia Jameson Brown Black
Tabby Male $2850 – SOLD sophia Hugo Smoke Polydactyl Male $3500 – SOLD sophia Oscar
Brown Tabby Poly Male $2850 – SOLD magnus Magnus Black Silver Tabby Male $2850- SOLD
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magnus magnus archie Archie High Red Silver Male $2850 – SOLD archie archie esme Esme
Black Silver Female $2750 – SOLD esme esme fredrick Frederick Red Tabby Classic Male
$2500 – SOLD fredrick fredrick Edwardo Edwardo Brown Tabby Classic Male $2500 – SOLD
Edwardo edwardo eduardo edwardo octavia Octavia Brown Tortishell Female $2850 – SOLD
octavia octavia athena Athena High Silver Mackerel Tabby Female $2850- SOLD athena athena
melbourne Melbourne Black Silver Male $2500 ~ Sold melbourne melbourne duke Duke Blue and
White Classic Tabby Male $2850 – SOLD duke duke luna Luna Smoke Tortishell Female Female
$2800 – SOLD Luna Luna Geronimo Geronimo Black Solid Male Male $2850 ~ SOLD Luna
Geronimo Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Ares Solid White Male $2850
– SOLD Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira
and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Princess
Black Silver Mackerel Female $2350 – Sold Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty
Kitten Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira
and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Roxy Calico Tortishell Female $2250 – Sold Prince: Black Smoke Male-
Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Prince:
Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Milo Red Silver Male $2450 – Sold Prince:
Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor
Dynasty Kitten Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Picasso Silver Male
$2450 – Sold Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Prince: Black Smoke
Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten
Edgar Brown Tabby Male $2350 – Sold Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten
Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and
Luxor Dynasty Kitten Obsidian Black Smoke Male $2450 – Sold Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira
and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Prince: Black
Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Charlie Brown Tabby with White Mittens Male
Kahleesi & Mufasa Dynasty Sold Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten
Prince: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Bear: Black Smoke Male-Xira and Luxor
Dynasty Kitten Leo Male – Red Silver Sedona & Mufasa Dynasty Sold Bear: Black Smoke Male-
Xira and Luxor Dynasty Kitten Elsa - High Silver Maine Coons Kitten Nala Female- Brown
Tortishell Xira & Mufasa Dynasty Sold Elsa - High Silver Maine Coons Kitten Elsa - High Silver
Maine Coons Kitten Jasmine - Silver Maine Coons Kitten Benji Blue Solid Male Ivy & Mufasa
Dynasty Sold Jasmine - Silver Maine Coons Kitten Jasmine - Silver Maine Coons Kitten Marlena -
Black Silver Tortishell Maine Coons Kitten Nix Silver Tortishell Female Luxor & Kahleesi Dynasty
Sold Marlena - Black Silver Tortishell Maine Coons Kitten Marlena - Black Silver Tortishell Maine
Coons Kitten Marlena - Black Silver Tortishell Maine Coons Kitten Jinx Brown Tabby Male Xira &
Mufasa Dynasty Sold Marlena - Black Silver Tortishell Maine Coons Kitten Marlena - Black Silver
Tortishell Maine Coons Kitten Marlena - Black Silver Tortishell Maine Coons Kitten Marlena -
Black Silver Tortishell Maine Coons Kitten Odin Black Silver Male Empanada & Mufasa Dynasty
Sold Marlena - Black Silver Tortishell Maine Coons Kitten Houdini Black Smoke Male Jasmine &
Mufasa Dynasty Sold Marlena - Black Silver Tortishell Maine Coons Kitten Chester Brown Classic
Tabby Male Mufasa & Jasmine Dynasty Sold Marlena - Black Silver Tortishell Maine Coons Kitten



Diamond � Black Silver Tortishell Female Vdara & Mufasa Dynasty Sold Maine Coon Kittens for
Sale Near Arizona – Ethically Bred, Raised with Love ​Searching for Maine Coon kittens for sale
near Arizona? we’re proud to offer healthy, well-socialized, and registered Maine Coon kittens to
families across Arizona, including Phoenix, Tucson, Scottsdale, Mesa, Chandler, Gilbert, and
beyond. LMCooNCat is a dedicated, registered Maine Coon breeder offering well-socialized,
healthy kittens with strong pedigrees and sweet, confident temperaments. Our kittens are raised
in a home environment with daily interaction, ensuring they are affectionate, people-oriented, and
ready to thrive in their forever homes. ​ All breeding cats are DNA-tested for genetic conditions like
HCM, SMA, PK-def, hip Xray, Heart Echo and carefully selected for structure, temperament, and
health. We believe in responsible breeding practices that prioritize the long-term well-being of
every kitten we produce. ​ Families from nearby regions often reach out to us because they’re
looking for a breeder who values quality, transparency, and ethical standards. We invite
prospective families to contact us directly to learn more about our available kittens and upcoming
litters. If you're looking for a reputable Maine Coon breeder near Arizona, LMCooNCat is here to
help you find a beautiful, well-bred kitten you can trust and love. What Makes LMCooNCat's
Maine Coon Kittens So Special? At LMCooNCat, we place a strong emphasis on the long-term
health and soundness of every cat in our breeding program. Before any cat is considered for
breeding, they must pass a full panel of genetic testing, undergo a professional cardiac ultrasound
to screen for HCM, and receive hip X-rays to ensure optimal joint health. We carefully choose
only those cats that meet our strict criteria for physical soundness and verified lineage. While it's
impossible to eliminate all health risks in any living being, we go to great lengths to reduce them—
and our purchase contract reflects that, covering a wide range of potential health concerns to
protect both our kittens and their future families. ​ Our kittens grow up right by our side, not in
cages or isolated spaces. From an early age, they become familiar with household sounds and
routines—blow-dryers, vacuuming, even bathing—so that by the time they leave, they’re
comfortable, social, and ready to adjust with ease. We’re proud to say that in five years of
breeding, we’ve never had a kitten returned due to behavior, and our buyers consistently praise
the calm, friendly temperaments of our cats. ​ We’re deeply committed to maintaining breed
excellence, guided by official standards—not trends. Our breeding cats include multiple TICA
International Winners, Supreme Grand Champions, and CFA Grand Champions, selected not just
for titles but for structural quality and balance. We breed with integrity, putting health and
personality first—ensuring that every kitten we place can grow into a cherished, lifelong
companion. Due to such a high demand for our Maine Coon Kittens, prices are firm and non-
negotiable. We recommend reserving kittens shortly after they are born as they do not stay
“available” for long. We do not take reservations for kittens before they are born. You may,
however, put your name on the waiting list until your desired kitten is born. Once kittens are born,
pictures are posted and those on the waiting list are contacted. *Select kittens are available with
Breeding Rights. Prices may vary based on coloration. Those kittens come with a Pedigree.
Kittens leave for their new home at 12 weeks of age. All kittens receive their first shots and are
vet checked before leaving the home. Kittens come with a health certificate and a TICA
Registration Certificate.
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